I

Chief Executive

SC Business Services

Organisation 2 Franklin Street
BELFAST
BT2 8DQ

28" January 2020

Tel: 028 9536 3863
Email: FOIL.BSO@hscni.net
BY EMAIL

Our Ref: FOI_1160

Dear I

Your request for information was received on 27" December 2019 and was dealt with
under the terms of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Please be advised that the
Business Services Organisation (BSO) has now completed its search for the
information you requested with regards Historic PCA Data for the 1980’s and 1990’s
and NHS Hospital Dispensing.

Please accept my apologies for the delay in procuring this information.
Please find this information attached and below:

| have been advised by the Family Practitioner Services that BSO do not hold any
electronic data prior to the Year 2000. | have attached a publication dating to 1996/97
(Statistical Report, Central Services Agency, Pharmaceutical Services Section, and
April 1996 — March 1997).

{ have also been advised by the FPS that BSO do not hold information relating to
hospital dispensing relating to your re-request.

| hope that the information provided assists you. If you are dissatisfied in any way with
the handling of your request, you have the right to request a review. You should do
this as soon as possible or in any case within two months of the date of issue of this
letter.

In the event that you require a review to be undertaken, you can do so by writing to

Information Governance Manager,
2 Franklin Street,

Belfast,

BT2 8DQ

If, following an internal review, carried out by an independent decision making
panel, you remain dissatisfied in any way with the handling of the request, you
may make a complaint under Section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act, to

Providing Support to Health and Social Care



the Information Commissioner's Office and ask that they investigate whether the BSO
has complied with the terms of the Freedom of Information Act.

You can contact Information Commissioner at:

Website: WWW.iC0o.0rg.uk
Phone: 0303 123 1113

Email: casework@ico.org.uk

Post: Information Commissioner's Office
3rd Floor, 14 Cromac Place
Belfast
BT7 2JB

In most circumstances the Information Commissioner will not investigate a complaint
unless an internal review procedure has been carried out. However the Commissioner
has the option to investigate the matter at his discretion.

Yours Sjn ly,

[

Liam Mclvor
Chief Executive



FRESCRIPTIONS DISPENSED: ANALYSIS BY BNF CLASSIFICATION, NUMBER AND COST
TOTALS FOR CHEMISTS AND DISPENSING DOCTORS

Prescriptions Ingredient Cost Average Cost
THERAPEUTIC CLASS {Number} per prescription
BNF CLASSIFICATION 1996/97 1996/97 1396/97
{Millions} 2 {£ mill) E £

NORTHERN IRELAND TOTALS 21.22 100.00 198.19 1006.00
1. GASTRO-TNTESTINAL SYSTEM 2.08 9.81 36.53 18.44 17.53
1/1 |antacids 0.47 2.21 1.36 0.69 2.90
1/2 |antispasmodics and Other Drugs Altering

Gut Motility 0.11 0.54 1.18 0.60 10.36
1/3 |Ulecer Healing Drugs 0.78 3.65 29.40 14.84 37.92
1/4 [Antidiarrhoeal Drugs 0.09 0.44 0.25 0.13 2.70
1/5 |Treatment of Chronic Diarrhoeas 0.04 0.18 1.20 0.60 30.54
1/6 {Laxatives 0.47 2.24 2.15 1.09 4.53
1/7 |Preparations for Haemorrhoids 0.11 0.52 0.55 0.28 498
1/8 |stoma Care 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 8.46
1/9 |brugs affecting Intestinal Secretions 0.01 0.03 0.42 0.21 62.70
2, CARDIOVASCULAR SYSTEM 2.89 13.65 32.50 16.38 11.23
2/1 |[rPositive Inotropic Drugs 0.13 0.63 0.06 0.03 0.46
2/2 |Diuretics 0.63 2.99 2.00 1.01 3.16
2/3 [{Anti-arrythmic Drugs 0.03 0.14 0.46 0.23 15.30
2/4 |Beta-adrenoceptor Blocking Drugs 0.46 2.19 4.15 2.08 8.95
2/5 |[Anti-hypertensive Therapy 0.33 1.58 7.1¢6 3.61 21.40
2/6 [Nitrates, other Vasodilators and Calcium

Channel Blockers 0.84 3.97 12.96 6.54 15.40
2/1 |Sympathomimetics 0.00 0.00 0.01 0.00 25.36
2/8 |[Anticoagulants and Protamine 0.09 0.41 0.25 0.12 2.85
2/9 |Antiplatelet Drugs 0.23 1.10 0.61 0.31 2.63
2/11 |Antifibripolytic Drugs and Haemostatics 0.01 0.02 0.08 0.04 15.66
2/12 |Lipid-lowering Drugs 0.13 0.62 4.75 2.40 36.30
i, EESPIRATORY SYSTEM 2.22 10.45 25.01 12.62 11.28
3/t |Bronchodilaters 1.01 4.75 9.36 4.72 9.29
3/2 |Corticosteroids 0.40 1.86 12.52 6.32 31.64
3/3 |Cromoglycate and related Therapy 0.03 0.13 0.43 0.22 16.21
3/4 antihistamines, hyposensitisation and

Allergic Disorders 0.25 1.20 1.26 0.63 4.95
3/5 |Respizatory Stimulants and Surfactants 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 12.26
3/6 |oxygen 0.02 0.12 0.49 0.25 19.74
3/7 [Mucolytics 0.00 0.00 0.42 0.21 456.51
3/8 |Aromatic Inhalants 0.00 0.01 0.00 0.00 0.79
3/9 {aAntitussives 0.32 1.52 0.21 0.11 0.66
3/10 |Systemic Nasal Decongestants 0.18 0.86 0.32 0.16 1.76
4. CENTRAL NERVOUS SYSTEM 4.78 22.50 28.93 14.60 6.05
4/1 |Hypnotics and Anxiolytics 1.04 4.90 1.69 g.85 1.63
4/2 Drugs used in Psychoses and related

bisorders 0.28 1.30 1.79 0.91 6.49
4/3 |Antidepressant Drugs 0.62 2.92 11.29% 5.70 18.19
4/4 |Central Nervous Stimulants 0.00 0.01 0.02 0.01 8.11
4/5 |Appetite Suppressants 0.01 0.03 0.04 0.02 5.86
4/6 |Dbrugs used in Nausea and Vertige 0.22 1.05 1.76 0.89 7.88
4/7 |mnalgesics 2.33 10.98 8.75 4.41 3.75
4/8 [Antieplleptics 0.19 0.91 2.60 1.31 13.51
4/9 |brugs used in Parkinsonism and related

bisorders 0.0%9 0.40 0.987 0.49 11.35
4/10 |prugs used in Substance Dependence 0.00 0.00 0.02 0.01 23.81
5. INFECTIONS 2.52 11.88 11.41 5.75 4,53
5/1 [Antibacterial Drugs 2.34 11.056 9.30 4.69 3.96
5/2 |Antifungal Drugs 0.08 0.38 1.06 0.53 13.27
5/3 JAntiviral Drugs 0.01 0.05 0.87 0.44 81.49
5/4 |Antiprotozoal 0.06 0.31 0.15 0.07 2.28
5/5 |Anthelmintics 0.02 0.09 0.04 0.02 1.91
6. ENDOCRINE SYSTEM 0.82 3.87 11.25 5.68 13.70
6/1 |Drugs used in Diabetes 0.22 1.03 3.34 1.68 15.24
6/2 {Thyroid and Antithroid Drugs 0.21 0.98 0.17 0.09 0.83
6/3 [Corticosterocids 0.01 0.05 0.87 0.44 B81.49
6/4 |Sex Hormones 0.82 3.87 11.25 5.68 13.70
6/5 |Hypothalmic and Pituitary Hormones and

Anti~ Oestrogens 0.82 3.87 11.25 5.68 13.70
6/6 |Drugs affecting Bone Metabolism 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6/7 |{Other Endocrine Drugs 0.01 0.05 0.87 0.44 81.49
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Prescriptions Ingredient Cost Average Cost
THERAPEUTIC CLASS (Number) per prescription
BNF CLASSIFICATION 1996/97 1996/97 1996/97
{Millions) 3 (£ mill) % £
7. OBSTETRICS, ‘GYNAECOLOGY AND
URINARY-TRACY DISORDERS 0.43 2.04 3.12 1.57 7.21
7/1 |[Drugs acting on Smooth Muscle 0.00 0.00 0.01 0.00 16.41
7/2 |Treatment of Vaginal and Vulval Conditions 0.09 0.44 0.52 0.26 5.60
7/3 |{Contraceptives 0.26 1.21 1.31 0.66 5.11
7/4 |Drugs for Genito-Urinary Disorders 0.08 0.39 1.28 0.65 15.51
8. MALIGNANT DISEASE AND FOR
IMMUNOSUEPRESSION 0.07 0.31 4.92 2.48 74.46
8/1 |[Cytotoxic Drugs ¢.01 0.03 0.09 0.04 12.05
8/2 |Drugs affecting the Immune Response 0.02 0.08 1.77 0.89 107.178
8/3 |Sex Hormone and Antagonists in Malignant 0.04 0.20 3.07 1.55 12,29
Disease
9. NUTRITION AND BLOOD 0.76 3.88 6.84 3.44 8.98
9/1 |Anaemias and some other Blood Disorders 0.24 1.12 0.55 0.28 2.31
; ]19/2 |Fluids and Electrolytes 0.08 0.37 0.20 0.10 2.60
.{ 9/3 |Intravenous Nutrition 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 44.63
"% 19/4 [Oral Nutrition 0.17 0.8C 4.93 2,49 29.05
89/5 |Minerals 0.04 0.20 0.26 0.13 6.21
- |9/6 |Vitamins 0.23 1.09 0.88 0.44 ~3.82
.ﬁ 9/7 |Bitterzs and Tonics 0.00 0.01 0.00 0.00 0.62
10. |MUSCULOSKELETAL AND JOINT DISEASES 1.00 4.72 9.81 4.96 9.80
! 10/1 {Drugs used in Rheumatic Diseases and Gout 0.72 3.40 7.96 4.02 11.063
10/2 |brugs used in Neuromuscular Disorders 0.03 0.12 0.25 0.13 89.66
10/3 |Drugs used for the relief of Soft-tissue 0.25 1.20 1.6l 0.81 6.33
. Inflanmation
= fii. {E= 0.37 1.76 1.52 0.76 4.10
11/1 |Administration of Drugs to The Eye 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.56
! 11/3 |Anti-infective Eye Preparations 0.16 0.73 0.26 0.13 1.66
11/4 |Corticosteroids and other
Anti- inflammatory Preparations 0.05 0.25 0.24 g.12 4.68
11/% |Mydriatics and Cycloplegics 0.00 0.02 0.01 0.00 1.76
. 11/6 |Treatment of Glaucoma 0.09 0.41 0.72 0.36 8.34
= |11/7 fLocal Anaesthetics 0.00 0.01 0.02 0.01 13.85
11/8 |Miscellaneous Ophthalmic Preparations 0.07 0.31 0.25 0.13 3.77
. 11/9 {Contact Lenses 0.01 0.03 0.02 0.01 4.12
~ |12. |EAR, NOSE AND OROPHARYNX 0.45 2.12 1.86 06.94 4.15
12/1 |Drugs acting on the Ear 0.10 0.49% 0.27 0.14 2.61
12/2 {Drugs acting on the Nose 0.14 0.68 1.04 0.52 7.21
{1273 |Drugs acting on the Oropharynx 06.20 0.95 0.55 0.28 2.75
. 13. |sxiN 1.95 9.19 11.00 5.55 5.64
13/1 {Vehicles and Diluents 0.01 0.03 0.02 0.01 2.79
13/2 |Emollient and Barrier Preparations 0.49 2.29 2.16 1.09 4.46
13/3 |Local Anaesthetics and Antipuritic
. Preparations 0.04 0.18 0.07 6.04 1.85
|13/ Topical Corticosteroids 0.48 2.25 1.66 0.84 3.48
13/5 |Preparations for Psoriasis and Eczema 0.10 0.46 1.99 1.01 20.28
. 13/6 |Preparations for Acne 0.10 0.46 0.91 0.46 9.39
W [13/7 |Preparations for Warts and Calluses 0.03 0.14 0.09 0.04 2.94
13/8 [Sunscreens and Camouflagers 0.02 0.08 0.10 0.05 5.581
13/9 |Shampoos and some other Scalp Preparations 0.10 0.49 0.36 0.18 3.45
. 13/10janti-infective Skin Preparations 0.46 2.17 2.43 1.22 5.28
M 113/11|Skin Disinfecting and Cleansing Agents 0.07 0.33 0.36 0.18 5.18
13/12|Antiperspirants 0.00 0.01 0.01 0.00 3.05
13/13|Wound Management Products 0.086 0.28 0.82 0.42 13.86
. 13/14{Topical Preparations for Circulatory
- Disorders 0.01 0.02 0.01 0.01 1.98
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Prescriptions Ingredient Cost Average Cost
THERAPEUTIC CLASS {Number) per prescription
BNF CLASSIFICATION 1996/97 1986/97 1856/97
(Millions} 3 (£ mill} 1 £
14, |DMMUNOLOGICAL PRODUCTS AND VACCINES 0.06 0.27 1.44 0.72 24.67
14/4 |Vaccines and Antisera 0.06 0.27 1.40 0.70 24.11
14/5% |Immuncglobins D.00 0.00 0.05 0.02 80.64
i5. |aANAETHESIA 0.01 0.05 0.05 0.03 6.04
15/1 |General Anaesthesia 0.00 0.01 0.01 0.01 10.60
15/2 [Local Anaesthesia 0.01 0.04 0.04 0.02 5.35
18. |PREPARATIONS USED IN DIAGHOSIS 0.06 0.29 1.23 0.62 20.02
18/1 |Urine Testing Reagents 0.0%L 0.05 0.04 0.02 3.80
18/2 |Blood Testing Reagents 0.05 0.24 1.19 0.60 23.41
18/3 |X-zay Contrast Media 0.00 0.00 ¢.00 0.00 48.30
19. |OTHER DRUGS AND PREPARATIONS 0.00 0.01 0.01 0.01 2.74
19/2 |Selective Preparations 06.00 0.00 0.01 0.00 21.91
19/4 |Single Substances 0.00 0.01 0.00 6.00 0.78
19/5 |other Preparations 0.00 0.00 0.00 6.00 1.02
19/6 |acids 0.00 ¢.00 0.00 0.00 1.04
19/9 Disinfectants, Preservatives and
Sterilising Agents 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.01 0.32
20. |DRESSINGS 0.30 1.42 3.34 1.67 11.14
20/1 |Absorbent Cottons 0.01 0.06 0.05 0.02 4,106
20/2 [Arm Slings/Bandages 0.01 0.03 0.11 0.06 17.495
20/3 |Dressings and Dressing Packs 0.14 0.68 2.47 1.24 17.09
20/4 |Gauzes and Gauze Tissue 0.01 0.03 0.04 0.02 8.11
20/5 |Tracheostomy Protectors 0.00 0.00 0.02 0.01 33.67
20/7 {Lints 0.00 0.01 0.01 0.00 6.86
20/8 |plasters 0.00 0.01 0.01 0.00 4.43
20/9 {Stockinette 0.01 0.07 0.07 0.03 4.49
20/10185urgical Adhesive Tapes 0.07 0.33 0.18 0.09 2.55
20/11}Surgical Sutures 0.00 0.00 0.01 0.0L 30.71
20/12}Swabs 0.04 0.20 0.37 0.19 g.58
21. |APPLIARCES 0.19 0.86 1.95 0.98 10.54
21/1 |Other Rppliances 0.06 0.28 0.42 0.21 6.93
21/2 |Catheters 0.01 0.04 0.40 0.20 42.18
21/3 |Chirepody Appliances 0.00 0.01 0.01 0.00 4.07
21/4 [Contraceptive Devices 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.86
21/6 |Trusses 0.060 0.00 0.01 0.01 22.02
21/7 |Elastic Hosiery 0.11 0.52 1.11 0.56 10.00
21/8 |Oxygen Masks 0.00 0.01 0.00 0.00 2.03
22. |INCONTINENCE APPLIANCES 0.02 0.11 0.82 0.41 37.61
22/30 Incontinence Sheaths 0.01 0.03 0.33 0.16 52.74
22/50|Leqg Bags 0.01 0.05 .40 0.20 39.29
22/60|Night Drainage Bags 0.01 0.03 0.0% 0.05 17.43
22/7C|Suspensory Systems 0.00 ¢.00 0.00 0.00 49.89
22/80Tubing and Accessories ¢.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 29.47
23. STOMA. APPLIANCES 0.04 0.16 2.25 1.10 62.69
23/5 jAdhesive Discs/Rings/Pads/Plasters 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 21.43
23/10|adhesive (Pastes) 0.00 0.00 0.02 .01 31.22
23/15|Adhesive (Sprays) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 17.64
23/20|Bag Closures 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 11.23
23/25|Bag Covers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 21.48
23/30]Belts 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 13.08
23/35|Colostomy Bags 0.01 0.03 0.83 0.42 122.47
23/40|Colostomy Sets 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 51.55
23/45|Decdorants 0.00 0.01 0.01 0.00 6.00
23/50{Filters/Bridges 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 19.07
23/55|Flanges 4.00 ¢.00 0.01 0.00 90.88
23/60]Ileostomy Bags 0.00 0.02 0.34 0.17 95.87
23715 Pressure Plates /Shields 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.50
23/80{Skin Fillers and Protectives 0.01 0.03 0.09 0.04 13.08
23/85|Skin Protectors 0.00 0.01 0.09 0.04 41.63
23/90|Stoma Caps/Dressings 0.00 0.00 o.o0 G.00 75.83
23/92|Tubing 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 55.2¢6
23/94iTwo Piece Ostomy Systems 0.01 0.06 0.7¢ 0.38 60.68
23/96jUrostomy Bags 0.00 0.00 0.08 0.04 106.28
99, |UNCLASSIFIED 0.20 0.93 2.41 1.22 12.23
99/1 |Unclassified 0.20 0.93 2.41 1.22 12.23
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